
No. 18031

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA
and 

MEXICO

Exchange of letters constituting an agreement relating to ad 
ditional co-operative arrangements to curb illegal pro 
duction and traffic in narcotic drugs. Mexico City, 
16 February 1977

Exchange of letters constituting an agreement amending the 
above-mentioned Agreement. Mexico City, 28 July 1977

Exchange of letters constituting an agreement extending the 
above-mentioned Agreement of 16 February 1977, as 
amended. Mexico City, 19 December 1977

Exchange of letters constituting an agreement amending the 
above-mentioned Agreement of 16 February 1977, as 
amended and extended. Mexico City, 3 January 1978

Authentic texts: English and Spanish.
Registered by the United States of America on 14 November 1979.

Vol. 1148,1-18031



4 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités_____1979

EXCHANGE OF LETTERS CONSTITUTING AN AGREEMENT1 BE 
TWEEN THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA AND MEXICO RE 
LATING TO ADDITIONAL COOPERATIVE ARRANGEMENTS 
TO CURB ILLEGAL PRODUCTION AND TRAFFIC IN NARCOTIC 
DRUGS

EMBASSY OF THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA

February 16, 1977

Dear Mr. Attorney General:
In confirmation of recent conversations between officials of our two govern 

ments relating to the cooperation between Mexico and the United States to curb the 
illegal traffic in narcotics, I am pleased to advise you that the Government of the 
United States is willing to enter into additional cooperative arrangements with the 
Government of Mexico to reduce such traffic,

1. The United States Government will reimburse and/or advance the Government of
Mexico in an amount not to exceed Two Hundred and Fifty Thousand Dollars ($250,000) for
contract services beginning January 1, 1977, for:
A. The provision of a rotary wing flight instructor for training Mexican pilots in aerial spray 

ing techniques for a period of twelve (12) months.
B. The provision of a spray and ground support equipment technician to work with and train 

Mexican personnel for a period of twelve (12) months.
C. The provision of a STOL aircraft (Pilatus Porter) flight instructor for training of Mexican 

pilots for a period not to exceed four (4) months.
D. The provision of a STOL aircraft (Pilatus Porter) mechanic to maintain the aircraft and to 

train Mexican personnel for a period not to exceed thirty (30) days.
2. Additionally, the Government of the United States will reimburse and/or advance the 

Government of Mexico in an amount equal to the cost of supplements to salaries in order to 
augment the present wage-scale restrictions of the Office of the Attorney General for Mexican 
support personnel as mutually agreed upon exclusively dedicated to the program to curb illegal 
production and trafficking in narcotics for a period of twelve (12) months and in an amount not 
to exceed Three Hundred Thousand Dollars ($300,000).

3. The Government of Mexico agrees to provide the resources required for the most 
effective use of the training provided and also agrees to adhere to the training program 
schedules once mutually developed and implemented. Additionally, the Government of Mexico 
agrees to provide supporting documents periodically as mutually agreed upon to substantiate 
all disbursement made on a reimbursable and/or advance basis and will undertake to propose 
the elimination of the present wage-scale restrictions of the Office of the Attorney General for 
Mexican support personnel at the earliest possible date as well as assure adequate budgetary 
resources to meet such costs subsequent to the period specified in paragraph 2 above.

4. The total cost to the Government of the United States for reimbursement to the Gov 
ernment of Mexico under this agreement will not exceed Five Hundred and Fifty Thousand

1 Came into force on 16 February 1977 by the exchange of the said letters. 

Vol. 1148,1-18031



1979 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités

Dollars ($550,000). It is understood that the provisions of all previous agreements between the 
Government of the United States and the Government of Mexico in relation to the narcotics 
control effort of the Government of Mexico remain in full force and effect, and applicable to 
this agreement unless otherwise expressly modified herein.

If the foregoing is acceptable to the Government of Mexico, this letter and your 
reply will constitute an agreement between our two governments.

I take this opportunity to reiterate to you the assurance of my highest considera 
tion and personal esteem.

[Signed]
HERBERT B. THOMPSON 

Chargé d'affaires ad interim

His Excellency Lie. Oscar Flores 
Attorney General of the Republic 
Mexico, D.F.

II

[SPANISH TEXT — TEXTE ESPAGNOL]

ESTADOS UNIDOS MEXICANOS 
PROCURADURIA GENERAL DE LA REPÛBLICA

Mexico, D.F., a 16 de febrero de 1977
Excelentisimo senor:

Me es grato dar respuesta a su atenta comunicaciôn de 16 de los corrientes, cuyo 
texto traducido al espanol es el siguiente:

"Confirmando las recientes conversaciones entre funcionarios de nuestros 
dos gobiernos relativas a la cooperaciôn entre Mexico y los Estados Unidos para 
frenar el tràfico ilegal de estupefacientes, me complace avisarle que el Gobierno 
de los Estados Unidos esta dispuesto a concertar con el Gobierno de Mexico ar- 
reglos coopératives adicionales para reducir dicho trafico.

1. El Gobierno de los Estados Unidos reembolsarà y/o adelantarà al Gobierno de 
Mexico una suma que no excédera de doscientos cincuenta mil dôlares (US$250.000) por 
servicios contratados, comenzando el 1 de enero de 1977, para: 
A. Un piloto instructor de ala rotativa para entrenar pilotos mexicanos en las técnicas de

fumigaciôn aérea por un perfodo de doce (12) meses. 
B. Un técnico de equipo de fumigaciôn y equipo de apoyo terrestre para trabajar con y

entrenar personal mexicano por un période de doce (12) meses. 
C. Un piloto instructor de avion STOL (Pilatus Porter) para entrenar pilotos mexicanos

por un période que no excédera de cuatro (4) meses. 
D. Un mecânico de avion tipo STOL (Pilatus Porter) para mantener el avion y entrenar a

personal mexicano por un perfodo que no excédera de treinta (30) di'as.
2. Ademâs, el Gobierno de los Estados Unidos reembolsarà y/o adelantarà al 

Gobierno de Mexico por un monto igual al costo de remuneraciôn complementaria a sala-

Vol. 1148,1-18031



1979 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités_______7

[TRANSLATION 1 —TRADUCTION2 ]

The Mexican Attorney General to the American Chargé d'affaires ad intérim

UNITED MEXICAN STATES 
OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL OF THE REPUBLIC

Mexico, D.F., February 16, 1977
Excellency:

I am pleased to reply to your letter of February 16, 1977, the text of which, 
translated into Spanish, reads as follows:

[See letter I]
I should like to inform you that the terms of the letter transcribed above are ac 

ceptable to the Government of Mexico.
I avail myself of this opportunity to renew to Your Excellency the assurances of 

my highest consideration.
[Signed]
OSCAR FLORES

Attorney General of the Republic 
[Universal suffrage. No réélection]

Mr. Herbert B. Thompson 
Chargé d'affaires ad interim 
Mexico, D.F.

1 Translation supplied by the Government of the United States of America.
2 Traduction fournie par le Gouvernement des Etats-Unis d'Amérique.

Vol. 1148,1-18031



United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités 1979

EXCHANGE OF LETTERS CONSTITUTING AN AGREEMENT1 
BETWEEN THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA AND MEXICO 
AMENDING THE AGREEMENT OF 16 FEBRUARY 19772 RELAT 
ING TO ADDITIONAL COOPERATIVE ARRANGEMENTS TO 
CURB ILLEGAL PRODUCTION AND TRAFFIC IN NARCOTIC 
DRUGS

EMBASSY OF THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA

July 28, 1977
Dear Mr. Attorney General:

In confirmation of recent conversations between officials of our two governments 
relating to the cooperation between Mexico and the United States to curb illegal traffic 
in narcotics, I am pleased to advise you that the Government of the United States, 
represented by the Embassy of the United States of America, is willing to enter into ad 
ditional cooperative arrangements with the Government of Mexico, represented by the 
Office of the Attorney General of the Republic, to reduce such traffic. These additional 
arrangements are for the effect of extending or amending prior cooperative arrange 
ments to the extent provided herein.

The United States Government agrees to make the following changes in the agree 
ment effected by an exchange of letters dated February 16, 1977: 2
(a) In the [fifth] line of numbered paragraph two of the Embassy's letter, add the 

words "beginning on January 1,1977," following the words "twelve (12) months";
(b) In the [sixth] line of numbered paragraph two of the Embassy's letter, delete the 

words "Three Hundred Thousand Dollars ($300,000)" and substitute therefor the 
words "Eight Hundred Thousand Dollars ($800,000)";

(c) In the [second] and [third] lines of numbered paragraph four of the Embassy's let 
ter, delete the words "Five Hundred and Fifty Thousand Dollars ($550,000)" and 
substitute therefor the words "One Million Fifty Thousand Dollars ($1,050,000)". 
It is understood that the remaining provisions of the agreement dated Febru 

ary 16, 1977, and of all previous agreements between the Government of the United 
States and the Government of Mexico in relation to the narcotics control effort of the 
Government of Mexico remain in full force and effect, and applicable to this agreement 
unless otherwise expressly modified herein.

If the foregoing is acceptable to the Government of Mexico, this letter and your 
reply will constitute an agreement between our two governments.

1 Came into force on 28 July 1977 by the exchange of the said letters.
2 See p. 4 of this volume.

Vol. 1148,1-18031



1979 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités_______9

I take this opportunity to reiterate to you the assurance of my highest considera 
tion and personal esteem.

Sincerely,
[Signed]
PATRICK J. LUCE Y 

Ambassador
His Excellency Lie. Oscar Flores 
Attorney General of the Republic 
Mexico, D.F.

II

[SPANISH TEXT — TEXTE ESPAGNOL]
ESTADOS UNIDOS MEXICANOS 

PROCURADURIA GENERAL DE LA REPÛBLICA
Mexico, D.F., a 28 de julio de 1977

Oficio No. 1/466
Estimado Senor Embajador:

Me es grato dar respuesta a su atenta comunicacion del dia de hoy, cuyo texto 
traducido al espanol es el siguiente:

"Confirmando recientes conversaciones entre funcionarios de nuestros dos 
Gobiernos, relativas a la cooperaciôn entre Mexico y los Estados Unidos para fre- 
nar el trâflco y la producciôn ilegal de estupefacientes, me complace avisarle que 
el Gobierno de los Estados Unidos, representado por la Embajada de los Estados 
Unidos de America, esta dispuesto a concertar con el Gobierno de Mexico, rep 
resentado por la Oficina del Procurador General de la Repûblica, arreglos co 
operatives adicionales para reducir dicho tràfico. Estos arreglos adicionales 
tienen el efecto de prorrogar o enmendar arreglos cooperatives previos en la 
medida aqui prevista.

El Gobierno de los Estados Unidos esta de acuerdo a efectuar los cambios 
siguientes al Acuerdo efectuado por un intercambio de cartas con fecha 16 de 
febrero de 1977:
(a) En la [quinta] h'nea del pârrafo numerado dos de la carta de la Embajada, 

agréguense las palabras "empezando el primero de enero de 1977," después 
de las palabras "doce (12) meses";

(b) En la [sexta] h'nea del pârrafo numerado dos de la carta de la Embajada, 
supn'manse las palabras "trescientos mil dôlares ($300.000)" y substitûyanse 
las palabras "ochocientos mil dôlares ($800.000)"; y

(c) En la [segunda] y [tercera] h'nea del pârrafo numerado cuatro de la carta de 
la Embajada, supn'manse las palabras "quinientos cincuenta mil dôlares 
($550.000)" y substitûyanse las palabras "un millôn cincuenta mil dôlares 
($1.050.000)."
Se tiene por entendido que todas las disposiciones restantes del Acuerdo con 

fecha 16 de febrero de 1977, y todos los Acuerdos previos entre el Gobierno de 
los Estados Unidos y el Gobierno de Mexico para el control de estupefacientes

Vol. 1148,1-18031



10 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités_____1979

permanecen en pleno vigor y efecto y son aplicables a este Acuerdo a menos de 
que se modifique expresamente aquf.

Si lo antedicho es aceptable al Gobierno de Mexico, esta carta y su con- 
testaciôn constituiràn un acuerdo entre nuestros dos Gobiernos.

Aprovecho esta oportunidad para reiterar a usted las seguridades de mi mas 
alta consideraciôn y estima personal."
Deseo expresar a usted que el Gobierno de Mexico esta de acuerdo en los ter 

mines de la nota transcrita.
Aprovecho la ocasiôn para expresar a Su Excelencia la seguridad de mi mas 

elevada consideraciôn.
Sufragio efectivo. No réélection 

El Procurador General de la Repûblica,
[Signed — Signé] 
Lie. OSCAR FLORES

Excelentfsimo Senor Patrick J. Lucey 
Embajador Extraordinario y Plenipotenciario

de los Estados Unidos de America 
Ciudad

[TRANSLATION 1 —TRADUCTION2 ]

UNITED MEXICAN STATES 
OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL OF THE REPUBLIC

Mexico, D.F., July 28, 1977
No. 1/466
Dear Mr. Ambassador:

I take pleasure in replying to your note of this day, the text of which, translated 
into Spanish, reads as follows:

[See letter 1}
I wish to inform you that the Government of Mexico agrees with the terms of the 

note transcribed above.
I avail myself of this opportunity to renew to Your Excellency the assurances of 

my highest consideration.
[Signed]
OSCAR FLORES

Attorney of the Republic
[Universal suffrage. No réélection]

His Excellency Patrick J. Lucey
Ambassador Extraordinary and Plenipotentiary

of the United States of America 
Mexico, D.F.

1 Translation supplied by the Government of the United States of America.
2 Traduction fournie par le Gouvernement des Etats-Unis d'Amérique.

Vol. 1148,1-18031



1979_____United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités______11

EXCHANGE OF LETTERS CONSTITUTING AN AGREEMENT' BE 
TWEEN THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA AND MEXICO 
EXTENDING THE AGREEMENT OF 16 FEBRUARY 1977 2 RELAT 
ING TO ADDITIONAL COOPERATIVE ARRANGEMENTS TO 
CURB ILLEGAL PRODUCTION AND TRAFFIC IN NARCOTIC 
DRUGS, AS AMENDED3

EMBASSY OF THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA

December 19, 1977
Dear Mr. Attorney General:

In confirmation of recent conversations between officials of our two govern 
ments relating to the cooperation between Mexico and the United States to curb il 
legal traffic in narcotics, I am pleased to advise you that the Government of the 
United States, represented by the Embassy of the United States of America, is willing 
to enter into additional cooperative arrangements with the Government of Mexico 
represented by the Office of the Attorney General of the Republic, to reduce such 
traffic. These additional arrangements are for the effect of extending or amending 
prior cooperative arrangements to the extent provided herein.

The United States Government agrees to make the following change in the 
agreement effected by an exchange of letters dated February 16, 1977, 2 as previously 
amended by an exchange of letters dated July 28, 1977: 3

In the [fifth] line of numbered paragraph two of the Embassy's letter dated 
February 16, 1977, delete the words, "twelve (12) months" and substitute there 
for the words "twenty-two (22) months".
It is understood that the remaining provisions of the agreement dated Febru 

ary 16, 1977, as amended, and of all previous agreements between the Government 
of the United States and the Government of Mexico in relation to the narcotics con 
trol effort of the Government of Mexico remain in full force and effect, and ap 
plicable to this agreement unless otherwise expressly modified herein.

If the foregoing is acceptable to the Government of Mexico, this letter and your 
reply will constitute an agreement between our two governments.

1 Came into force on 19 December 1977 by the exchange of the said letters.
2 See p. 4 of this volume.
3 See p. 8 of this volume.

Vol. 1148,1-18031



12 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités_____1979

I take this opportunity to reiterate to you the assurance of my highest considera 
tion and personal esteem. 

Sincerely,
[Signed]
PATRICK J. LUCEY 

Ambassador

His Excellency Lie. Oscar Flores 
Attorney General of the Republic 
Mexico, D.F.

II

[SPANISH TEXT — TEXTE ESPAGNOL]

ESTADOS UNIDOS MEXICANOS 
PROCURADURÏA GENERAL DE LA REPÛBLICA

Mexico, D.F., a 19 de diciembre de 1977

Estimado Senor Embajador:
Me es grato dar respuesta a su atenta comunicacion fechada el dia de hoy, cuyo 

texto traducido al espanol es el siguiente:
"Confirmado recientes conversaciones entre funcionarios de nuestros dos 

Gobiernos, relativas a la cooperation entre Mexico y los Estados Unidos para fre- 
nar el trâfico y la production ilegal de estupefacientes, me complace avisarle que 
el Gobierno de los Estados Unidos, representado por la Embajada de los Estados 
Unidos de America, esta dispuesto a concertar con el Gobierno de Mexico, 
representado por la Oficina del Procurador General de la Republica, arreglos 
cooperativos adicionales para reducir dicho trâfico. Estos arreglos adicionales 
tienen el efecto de prorrogar o enmendar arreglos cooperativos previos en la 
medida aqui prevista.

El Gobierno de los Estados Unidos esta de acuerdo a efectuar el cambio 
siguiente al Acuerdo efectuado por un intercambio de cartas con fecha 16 de 
febrero de 1977, de conformidad con la enmienda previa ejecutada en el inter 
cambio de cartas con fecha 28 de julio de 1977.

En la [quinta] h'nea del pârrafo numerado dos de la carta de la Emba 
jada con fecha de 16 de febrero de 1977, suprfmanse las palabras "doce (12) 
meses" y substitûyanse las palabras "veintidôs (22) meses". 
Se tiene por entendido que todas las disposiciones restantes del Acuerdo con 

fecha 16 de febrero de 1977, de conformidad con las enmiendas y todos los 
Acuerdos previos entre el Gobierno de los Estados Unidos y el Gobierno de 
Mexico para el control de estupefacientes permanecen en pleno vigor y efecto y 
son aplicables a este Acuerdo a menos de que se modifique expresamente aquf. 

Si lo antedicho es aceptable al Gobierno de Mexico, esta carta y su con- 
testaciôn constituirân un acuerdo entre nuestros dos Gobiernos.

Aprovecho esta oportunidad para reiterar a usted las seguridades de mi mas 
alta consideration y estima personal."

Vol. 1148,1-18031



1979 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités______13

Deseo expresar a usted que el Gobierno de Mexico esta de acuerdo en los ter 
mines de la nota transcrita.

Aprovecho la ocasiôn para expresar a Su Excelencia la seguridad de mi mas 
elevada consideraciôn.

Sufragio efectivo. No reelecciôn 
El Procurador General de la Repûblica,

[Signed — Signé] 
Lie. OSCAR FLORES

Excelentfsimo Sefior Patrick J. Lucey 
Embajador Extraordinario y Plenipotenciario

de los Estados Unidos de America 
Ciudad

[TRANSLATION 1 —TRADUCTION 2 ]

UNITED-MEXICAN STATES 
OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL OF THE REPUBLIC

Mexico, D.F., December 19, 1977

Dear Mr. Ambassador:
I am pleased to reply to your communication, dated today, the text of which, 

translated into Spanish, is as follows:
[See letter I]

I should like to inform you that the Government of Mexico concurs in the terms 
of the transcribed note.

I avail myself of this opportunity to express to Your Excellency the assurances 
of my highest consideration.

[Signed]
OSCAR FLORES

Attorney General of the Republic 
[Universal suffrage. No réélection]

His Excellency Patrick J. Lucey
Ambassador Extraordinary and Plenipotentiary

of the United States of America 
Mexico, D.F.

1 Translation supplied by the Government of the United States of America.
2 Traduction fournie par le Gouvernement des Etats-Unis d'Amérique.

Vol. 1148,1-18031



14 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités 1979

EXCHANGE OF LETTERS CONSTITUTING AN AGREEMENT 1 BE 
TWEEN THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA AND MEXICO 
AMENDING THE AGREEMENT OF 16 FEBRUARY 1977 2 RELAT 
ING TO ADDITIONAL COOPERATIVE ARRANGEMENTS TO 
CURB ILLEGAL PRODUCTION AND TRAFFIC IN NARCOTIC 
DRUGS, AS AMENDED3 AND EXTENDED4

EMBASSY OF THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA

January 3, 1978
Dear Mr. Attorney General:

In confirmation of recent conversations between officials of our two govern 
ments relating to the cooperation between Mexico and the United States to curb il 
legal traffic in narcotics, I am pleased to advise you that the Government of the 
United States, represented by the Embassy of the United States of America, is willing 
to enter into additional cooperative arrangements with the Government of Mexico, 
represented by the Office of the Attorney General of the Republic, to reduce such 
traffic. These additional arrangements are for the effect of extending or amending 
prior cooperative arrangements to the extent provided herein.

The United States Government agrees to make the following changes in the 
Agreement effected by an exchange of letters dated February 16, 1977, 2 as amended 
by an exchange of letters dated July 28, 1977, 3 and December 19, 1977: 4

In the [second] line of numbered paragraph one of the Embassy's letter
dated February 16, 1977, delete the word "fifty" and substitute therefor the word
"sixty" to read "Two Hundred and Sixty Thousand Dollars ($260,000)."

In the [second] line of numbered paragraph 1. A. of the Embassy's letter
dated February 16, 1977, delete the word "twelve" and substitute therefor the
words "thirteen and a half to read "thirteen and a half (13 1A) months."

In the [second] line of numbered paragraph 1. B. of the Embassy's letter
dated February 16, 1977, delete the word "twelve" and substitute therefor the
word "fifteen" to read "fifteen (15) months".

In the [second] and [third] line of numbered paragraph four of the
Embassy's letter dated February 16, 1977, as amended in letter of July 28, 1977,
delete the word "Fifty" and substitute therefor the word "Sixty" to read "One
Million Sixty Thousand Dollars ($1,060,000)".
It is understood that the remaining provisions of the agreement dated Febru 

ary 16, 1977, as amended, and of all previous agreements between the Government 
of the United States and the Government of Mexico in relation to the narcotics con 
trol effort of the Government of Mexico remain in full force and effect, and ap 
plicable to this agreement unless otherwise expressly modified herein.

1 Came into force on 3 January 1978 by the exchange of the said letters.
2 See p. 4 of this volume.
3 See p. 8 of this volume.
4 See p. 11 of this volume.

Vol. 1148,1-18031



1979 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités______15

If the foregoing is acceptable to the Government of Mexico, this letter and your 
reply will constitute an agreement between our two governments.

I take this opportunity to reiterate to you the assurance of my highest considera 
tion and personal esteem.

Sincerely,
[Signed]
PATRICK J. LUCEY 

Ambassador

His Excellency Lie. Oscar Flores 
Attorney General of the Republic 
Mexico, D.F.

II

[SPANISH TEXT — TEXTE ESPAGNOL]

ESTADOS UNIDOS MEXICANOS 
PROCURADURI'A GENERAL DE LA REPÛBLICA

Mexico, D.F., a 3 de enero de 1978

Estimado Senor Embajador:
Me es grato dar respuesta a su atenta comunicaciôn del dia de hoy, cuyo texto 

traducido al espanol es el siguiente:
"Confirmando recientes conversaciones entre funcionarios de nuestros dos 

Gobiernos, relativas a la cooperation entre Mexico y los Estados Unidos para fre- 
nar el trâfico y la producciôn ilegal de estupefacientes, me complace avisarle que 
el Gobierno de los Estados Unidos, representado por la Embajada de los Estados 
Unidos de America, esta dispuesto a concertar con el Gobierno de Mexico, 
representado por la Oficina del Procurador General de la Repûblica, arreglos 
cooperativos adicionales para reducir dicho trafico. Estos arreglos adicionales 
tienen el efecto de prorrogar o enmendar arreglos cooperativos previos en la 
medida aquf prevista.

El Gobierno de los Estados Unidos esta de acuerdo a efectuar el cambio 
siguiente al Acuerdo efectuado por el intercambio de cartas con fecha 16 de 
febrero de 1977, de conformidad con las enmiendas ejecutadas en el intercambio 
de cartas con fecha 28 de julio de 1977 y 19 de diciembre de 1977:

En la [segunda] Ifnea del pârrafo numerado uno de la carta de la Emba 
jada con fecha de 16 de febrero de 1977, suprfmase la palabra "cincuenta" y 
substitûyase por la palabra "sesenta", para que se lea: "doscientos sesenta 
mil dôlares ($260.000)".

En la [segunda] linea del pârrafo numerado LA. de la carta de la Emba 
jada con fecha 16 de febrero de 1977, suprfmase la palabra "doce" y 
substitûyase por la palabras "trece y medio", par que se lea: "trece y medio 
(13'/2)meses".

Vol. 1148,1-18031



16______United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités 1979

En la [segunda] Ifnea del pârrafo numerado 1 .B. de la carta de la Emba- 
jada con fecha 16 de febrero de 1977, suprimase la palabra "doce" y 
substitûyase por la palabra "quince", para que se lea: "quince (15) meses". 

En la [segunda] y [tercera] linea del pârrafo numerado 4 de la carta de la 
Embajada con fecha 16 de febrero de 1977, con las enmiendas en la carta 
con fecha 28 de julio de 1977, suprimase la palabra "cincuenta" y 
substitûyase por la palabra "sesenta" para que se lea: "un millôn sesenta mil 
dôlares($ 1.060.000)".
Se tiene por entendido que todas las disposiciones restantes del Acuerdo con 

fecha 16 de febrero de 1977, de conformidad con las enmiendas y todos los 
Acuerdos previos entre el Gobierno de los Estados Unidos y el Gobierno de 
Mexico para el control de estupefacientes permanecen en pleno vigor y efecto y 
son aplicables a este Acuerdo a menos de que se modifique expresamente aquf. 

Si lo antedicho es aceptable al Gobierno de Mexico, esta carta y su con- 
testaciôn constituiràn un acuerdo entre nuestros dos Gobiernos.

Aprovecho esta oportunidad para reiterar a usted las seguridades de mi mas 
alta consideraciôn y estima personal."
Deseo expresar a usted que el Gobierno de Mexico esta de acuerdo en los ter 

mines de la nota transcrita.
Aprovecho la ocasiôn para expresar a Su Excelencia la seguridad de mi mas 

elevada consideraciôn.

Sufragio efectivo. No reelecciôn 
El Procurador General de la Repùblica,

[Signed — Signé] 
Lie. OSCAR FLORES

Excelentfsimo Senor Patrick J. Lucey 
Embajador Extraordinario y Plenipotenciario

de los Estados Unidos de America 
Ciudad

[TRANSLATION 1 — TRADUCTION2 ]

UNITED MEXICAN STATES 
OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL OF THE REPUBLIC

Mexico, D.F., Januarys, 1978

Dear Mr. Ambassador:
I am pleased to reply to your letter of today, the text of which, translated into 

Spanish, reads as follows:
[See letter I]

1 Translation supplied by the Government of the United States of America.
2 Traduction fournie par le Gouvernement des Etats-Unis d'Amérique,

Vol. 1148,1-1803!



1979 United Nations — Treaty Series • Nations Unies — Recueil des Traités 17

I should like to inform you that the Government of Mexico concurs in the terms 
of the transcribed letter.

I avail myself of this opportunity to renew to Your Excellency the assurance of 
my highest consideration.

[Signed]
OSCAR FLORES

Attorney General of the Republic 
[Universal suffrage. No réélection]

His Excellency Patrick J. Lucey
Ambassador Extraordinary and Plenipotentiary

of the United States of America 
Mexico, D.F.

Vol. 1148,1-18031


